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Tender Clause No. Specified in the NIT To be Read as 

6.2.A.vi 
Statutory cover 

Audited Annual Accounts for last three 
years 2017-2018, 2018-2019 & 2019-
2020 or during the period since 
formation of the Firm, if it was set up in 
less than such 3- year period. ( to be 
submitted in “Accounts” folder )  

 
 

Audited Annual Accounts for last three 
years 2017-2018, 2018-2019 & 2019-
2020 or during the period since 
formation of the Firm, if it was set up in 
less than such 3- year period. ( to be 
submitted in “Accounts” folder )  

 
 

 
7.a 

Eligibility 
Criteria 

 

Average annual turnover from 
contracting business in 2017-2018, 
2018-2019 & 2019-2020 as stated in 
clause 6.2 A(v) & Form-2 should be 
at least 50% (70% in case of 
consortiums) of the amount put to 
tender of the works in which the 

contractor intends to participate. 

Average annual turnover from 
contracting business in 2017-2018, 
2018-2019 & 2019-2020  should be at 
least 50% (70% in case of consortiums) 
of the amount put to tender of the works 
in which the contractor intends to 
participate.  

 

 

          Sd/- 
Tender Evaluation Committee 

                                                                                                              University of Kalyani 

CORRIGENDUM   
 

Name of Work: Concreting the gap between boundary wall and existing building and 
fixing aluminium window, with S.S.Net in the Lilabati Bhawan, University of Kalyani.    


